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Bible Story

Wonderfully Made
Psalm 139:14; Genesis 1:26

All people are wonderfully made by God.
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MEMORY VERSE

“I am fearfully and
wonderfully made.”
Psalm 139:14, NIV
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Preschool
EN G AG E  I N  E V ERY DAY  M O M EN T S  TO G E T H ER
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Morning Time

When you go into your child’s room, say: 
“Good morning, [child’s name]! I see one of 
the most wonderful things that God made. 
Guess what it is! It’s YOU! God made you 
wonderful!”
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Drive Time

While on the go, talk about some of the 
amazing things God has made, like gigantic 
whales, trees that grow food, and the sun 
way up high. Then, talk about another 
wonderful thing God made . . . people!
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Bath Time

During bath time, say: “[Name of child] is 
wonderfully made by God.” Say this again, 
inserting names of people your child knows 
as well as community helpers: “[Name of 
person] is wonderfully made by God.”
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Cuddle Time

Cuddle with your child and pray: “God, 
when I look at [name of child], I am 
reminded of Your power and goodness. You 
made this tiny human and chose me to be 
their [title]. Thank You, Lord. Thank You.”
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